
B002169 PEST 

CONTROL

KIRKLAND AL PROF SVS KNOX ORKIN *ATEC

2012-2013 102.00$       2,142.00$      2,856.00$    7,248.00$        

SOUTHEAST CAMPUS 2013-2014 102.00$       2,142.00$      2,856.00$    7,248.00$        

(SECH) 2014-2015 102.00$       2,142.00$      2,856.00$    7,248.00$        

2015-2016 102.00$       2,142.00$      3,213.00$    7,248.00$        

2016-2017 102.00$       2,142.00$      3,213.00$    7,248.00$        

2012-2013 90.00$         1,890.00$      2,520.00$    6,240.00$        

CENTRAL CAMPUS 2013-2014 90.00$         1,890.00$      2,520.00$    6,240.00$        

(CCRH) 2014-2015 90.00$         1,890.00$      2,520.00$    6,240.00$        

2015-2016 90.00$         1,890.00$      2,835.00$    6,240.00$        

2016-2017 90.00$         1,890.00$      2,835.00$    6,240.00$        

2012-2013 56.00$         1,170.00$      1,560.00$    4,452.00$        

FRANK FRANZ HALL 2013-2014 56.00$         1,170.00$      1,560.00$    4,452.00$        

(FFH) 2014-2015 56.00$         1,170.00$      1,560.00$    4,452.00$        

2015-2016 56.00$         1,170.00$      1,755.00$    4,452.00$        

2016-2017 56.00$         1,170.00$      1,755.00$    4,452.00$        

2012-2013 85.00$         1,836.00$      2,448.00$    6,300.00$        

NORTH CAMPUS 2013-2014 85.00$         1,836.00$      2,448.00$    6,300.00$        

(NCRH) 2014-2015 85.00$         1,836.00$      2,448.00$    6,300.00$        

2015-2016 85.00$         1,836.00$      2,754.00$    6,300.00$        

2016-2017 85.00$         1,836.00$      2,754.00$    6,300.00$        

2012-2013 60.00$         600.00$         1,200.00$    4,200.00$        

FRATERNITY & 2013-2014 60.00$         600.00$         1,200.00$    4,200.00$        

SORORITY (FRSO) 2014-2015 60.00$         600.00$         1,200.00$    4,200.00$        

2015-2016 60.00$         600.00$         1,350.00$    4,200.00$        

2016-2017 60.00$         600.00$         1,350.00$    4,200.00$        

2012-2013 60.00$         1,320.00$      258.00$       2,420.00$        

FLOWERS 2013-2014 60.00$         1,320.00$      258.00$       2,420.00$        

SUBDIVISION 2014-2015 60.00$         1,320.00$      258.00$       2,420.00$        

2015-2016 60.00$         1,320.00$      290.00$       2,420.00$        

2016-2017 60.00$         1,320.00$      290.00$       2,420.00$        

2012-2013 105.00$       2,034.00$      NO BID 7,140.00$        

CHARGER 2013-2014 105.00$       2,034.00$      NO BID 7,140.00$        

VILLAGE 2014-2015 105.00$       2,034.00$      NO BID 7,140.00$        

2015-2016 105.00$       2,034.00$      NO BID 7,140.00$        

2016-2017 105.00$       2,034.00$      NO BID 7,140.00$        



2,790.00$   54,960.00$   56,920.00$ 190,000.00$   

*ATEC PEST  CONTROL BID RECEIVED BUT HE DID

NOT ATTEND THE MANDATORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE

This Bid has been Awarded by Total

Low to Kirkland's Pest Control, the apparent 

lowest bidder meeting the Specifications.


