ATHLETIC 2014 - 2015 WINTER BUSES (B002292)

SPIRIT COACH FIRST CLASS CAMELOT BUS |GRAY LINE OF |ADVENTURE BUS
CHARTER CHARTERS TENNESSEE CHARTER

LINE ITEM 2 OF THE WOMEN'S SOCCER HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
WOMEN'S SOCCER
1. 9/3/14-9/6/14 S 3,160.00 | $ 3,780.00 | S 3,430.00 | S 4,425.00 NO BID
2. 9/12/14 S 925.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,025.00 | $ 1,755.00 NO BID
3. 9/21/14 S 1,260.00 | $ 1,924.00 | $ 1,485.00 | $ 1,945.00 | $ 1,450.00
4. 10/3/14 - 10/5/14 S 2,475.00 | S 2,152.00 | S 2,325.00 | $ 3,245.00 | $ 3,000.00
5. 10/16/14 - 10/19/14 S 3,160.00 | $ 3,320.00 | S 3,415.00 | $ 4,375.00 | $ 3,950.00
6. 10/25/14 - 10/26/14 S 2,380.00 | S 3,556.00 | S 3,970.00 | $ 2,915.00 | $ 2,550.00

$ 12,435.00 | $ 14,732.00 | $ 14,625.00 | $ 16,905.00 | $ 10,950.00

LINE ITEM 1 & 5 OF THE MEN'S SOCCER HAVE BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID
LINE ITEM 7 OF THE MEN'S SOCCER, IS FOR THE CONFERENCE TOURNAMENT

MEN'S SOCCER
1. 9/4/14-9/7/14 S 3,160.00 | S 2,220.00 | S 2,354.00 | S 4,105.00 NO BID
2. 9/11/14-9/14/14 S 3,160.00 | S 3,060.00 | $ 3,375.00 | S 4,325.00 NO BID
3. 10/3/14 - 10/5/14 S 2,475.00 | S 2,152.00 | S 2,325.00 | S 3,245.00 | $ 3,000.00
4. 10/16/14 - 10/19/14 S 3,160.00 | S 3,060.00 | $ 3,375.00 | S 3,245.00 | $ 3,950.00
5. 10/24/14 S 925.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,025.00 | $ 1,675.00 NO BID
6. 10/31/14 S 1,260.00 | $ 1,924.00 | $ 1,485.00 | $ 1,835.00 | $ 1,450.00
7. 11/6/14 - 11/9/14 S 3,160.00 | S 3,060.00 | $ 3,375.00 | S 4,325.00 | $ 4,200.00
$ 12,290.00 | $ 11,956.00 [ $  12,910.00 | $ 15,300.00 | $ 12,600.00
VOLLEYBALL
1. 10/7/14 S 1,050.00 | $ 1,660.00 | $ 1,485.00 | $ 1,945.00 | $ 1,100.00
2. 10/10/14 - 10/11/14 S 2,380.00 | S 3,520.00 | S 2,815.00 | S 2,865.00 | S 2,550.00
3. 10/17/14 - 10/18/14 S 2,680.00 | S 3,426.00 | S 3,195.00 | S 2,915.00 | $ 2,550.00
4. 10/31/14-11/2/14 S 4,980.00 | $ 5,275.00 | $ 399.50 [ $ 4,215.00 | $ 3,700.00




$ 11,090.00 | $ 13,881.00 | $ 7,894.50 [ $ 11,940.00 [ $ 9,900.00
CROSS COUNTRY
1. 10/3/14 - 10/4/14 S 2,070.00 | S 2,540.00 | S 2,120.00 | S 2,535.00 | $ 2,350.00
2. 10/9/14 -10/11/14 S 2,845.00 | S 3,475.00 | S 2,995.00 | S 3,615.00 | S 3,300.00
3. 10/24/14 - 10/25/14 S 2,415.00 | S 2,940.00 | S 3,600.00 | S 2,700.00 NO BID
4. 11/7/14-11/8/14 S 1,640.00 | § 1,060.00 | S 1,025.00 | S 2,105.00 NO BID

$ 8,970.00 | $ 10,015.00 | $ 9,740.00 | $ 10,955.00 | $ 5,650.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 45,710.00 | $ 51,884.00 | $  46,194.50 | $ 56,775.00 | $ 39,100.00
FOB UAH UAH UAH UAH UAH
TERMS NET 30 N/A NET 10 N/A N/A
WARRANTY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
ESTIMATE DELIVERY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
YOUR REF. NO. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

60 DAYS AFTER

QUOTATION 7/23/2014 N/A N/A RECEIPT N/A
BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION B W8 B B SB

Camelot Bus Charters: Volleyball Line Item 4 was an error and the vendor is unable to deliver

at the quoted (error) price.

This Bid has been awarded by Line Item low, to the lowest responsible bidder who met the Bid Specifications.

[EMP: 7/22/14




