
ATHLETIC 2014-2015 WINTER/SPRING CHARTER BUSES (B002313)

CAPITAL 

TRAILWAYS

FIRST CLASS 

CHARTER SPIRIT COACH

CAMELOT BUS 

CHARTERS

ADVENTURE 

BUS CHARTER

GRAYLINE OF 

TENNESSEE CLINE TOURS

LINE ITEM 2 FOR THE MEN'S BASKETBALL TEAM HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THIS BID

MEN'S BASKETBALL

1.    12/1/14 773.00$                 1,135.00$           795.00$                  950.00$               950.00$              1,395.00$         1,282.00$           

2.     12/13/14 - 12/14/14 1,419.00$             1,635.00$           1,420.00$              1,475.00$            1,750.00$           1,870.00$         1,582.00$           

3.     12/18/14 760.00$                 1,175.00$           895.00$                  950.00$               1,050.00$           1,570.00$         1,272.00$           

4.     12/20/14 877.00$                 1,350.00$           925.00$                  950.00$               1,050.00$           1,570.00$         1,435.00$           

5.      1/10/15 1,227.00$             1,700.00$           1,230.00$              1,125.00$            1,150.00$           1,770.00$         2,064.00$           

6.      1/12/15 1,434.00$             2,175.00$           1,230.00$              1,250.00$            1,450.00$           1,870.00$         2,295.00$           

7.      1/21/15 - 1/24/15 3,165.00$             4,712.00$           2,930.00$              3,610.00$            3,650.00$           3,770.00$         5,382.00$           

8.      1/31/15 1,402.00$             1,916.00$           1,430.00$              1,301.00$            1,250.00$           1,830.00$         2,608.00$           

9.      2/11/15 - 2/14/15 3,117.00$             3,544.00$           2,860.00$              2,875.00$            3,500.00$           3,475.00$         4,636.00$           

10.   2/28/15 664.00$                 900.00$               795.00$                  900.00$               1,050.00$           1,175.00$         1,316.00$           

13,419.00$           18,607.00$         13,090.00$            13,911.00$          15,100.00$        18,425.00$       22,290.00$        

LINE ITEM 3 OF WOMEN'S BASKETBALL HAS BEEN CHANGED FROM 11/12/14 - 11/15/14 TO READ 11/12/14 - 11/16/14

WOMEN'S BASKETBALL

1.     11/6/14 1,580.00$             2,156.00$           1,240.00$              1,680.00$            1,500.00$           1,865.00$         2,191.00$           

2.     11/10/14 639.00$                 950.00$               795.00$                  900.00$               950.00$              1,495.00$         1,128.00$           

3.      11/12/14 - 11/16/14 5,932.00$             7,576.00$           5,650.00$              4,175.00$            7,950.00$           7,270.00$         9,875.00$           

4.      12/14/14 1,032.00$             1,532.00$           975.00$                  1,100.00$            1,050.00$           1,430.00$         1,522.00$           

5.       1/21/15 - 1/24/15 3,070.00$             4,612.00$           2,930.00$              3,612.00$            3,650.00$           3,770.00$         4,042.00$           

6.        2/11/14 - 2/14/15 3,070.00$             3,544.00$           2,860.00$              3,110.00$            3,750.00$           3,475.00$         4,060.00$           

15,323.00$           20,370.00$         14,450.00$            14,577.00$          18,850.00$        19,305.00$       22,818.00$        



CAPITAL 

TRAILWAYS

FIRST CLASS 

CHARTER SPIRIT COACH

CAMELOT BUS 

CHARTERS

ADVENTURE 

BUS CHARTER

GRAYLINE OF 

TENNESSEE CLINE TOURS

LINE ITEM 9 FOR THE SOFTBALL TEAM TBA  HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID

SOFTBALL

1.     2/21/15 - 2/22/15 1,419.00$             1,650.00$           1,570.00$              1,875.00$            1,700.00$           1,825.00$         1,935.00$           

2.     2/28/15 - 3/1/15 2,216.00$             3,380.00$           2,240.00$              2,408.00$            2,250.00$           1,840.00$         3,812.00$           

3.     3/13/15 - 3/15/15 2,349.00$             3,412.00$           2,980.00$              2,825.00$            3,750.00$           2,675.00$         4,043.00$           

4.     3/25/15 922.00$                 NO BID 995.00$                  1,025.00$            1,350.00$           1,370.00$         1,801.00$           

5.     3/25/15 721.00$                 NO BID 895.00$                  1,950.00$            1,050.00$           1,175.00$         1,316.00$           

6.     3/29/15 639.00$                 NO BID 895.00$                  1,950.00$            1,050.00$           1,175.00$         1,230.00$           

7.     4/11/15 1,434.00$             NO BID 1,240.00$              1,250.00$            2,300.00$           1,770.00$         2,969.00$           

8.     4/25/15 - 4/26/15 1,605.00$             NO BID 2,240.00$              1,989.00$            NO BID 1,825.00$         2,832.00$           

11,305.00$           8,442.00$           13,055.00$            15,272.00$          13,450.00$        13,655.00$       19,938.00$        

LINE ITEM 12 FOR THE BASEBALL TEAM TBA  HAS BEEN REMOVED FROM THE BID

BASEBALL

1.     2/10/15 1,256.00$             1,775.00$           1,190.00$              1,100.00$            1,150.00$           1,470.00$         1,880.00$           

2.     2/20/15 - 2/22/15 2,199.00$             2,400.00$           2,085.00$              1,875.00$            2,350.00$           2,670.00$         2,824.00$           

3.     2/27/15 - 3/1/15 2,290.00$             3,292.00$           2,240.00$              1,125.00$            3,450.00$           2,770.00$         3,731.00$           

4.     3/11/15 919.00$                 1,325.00$           995.00$                  1,025.00$            1,350.00$           1,370.00$         1,892.00$           

5.     3/13/15 - 3/15/15 2,337.00$             3,312.00$           2,980.00$              2,825.00$            3,750.00$           2,870.00$         4,043.00$           

6.     3/24/15 - 3/25/15 1,723.00$             NO BID 1,570.00$              1,900.00$            NO BID 1,960.00$         2,991.00$           

7.     4/1/15 688.00$                 NO BID 865.00$                  950.00$               950.00$              1,215.00$         1,561.00$           

8.     4/2/15 - 4/4/15 2,199.00$             NO BID 2,240.00$              2,850.00$            3,750.00$           3,095.00$         2,824.00$           

9.     4/15/15 1,023.00$             NO BID 1,190.00$              1,250.00$            1,150.00$           1,475.00$         2,109.00$           

10.   4/17/15 - 4/19/15 2,199.00$             NO BID 2,445.00$              3,000.00$            3,750.00$           3,095.00$         2,902.00$           

11.   4/25/15 - 4/26/15 1,419.00$             NO BID 1,950.00$              1,250.00$            NO BID 1,870.00$         1,935.00$           

18,252.00$           12,104.00$         19,750.00$            19,150.00$          21,650.00$        23,860.00$       28,692.00$        

GRAND TOTAL 58,299.00$           59,523.00$         60,345.00$            62,910.00$          69,050.00$        75,245.00$       93,738.00$        



FOB N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

TERMS N/A N/A NET 30 NET 5 Days N/A N/A NET 30

WARRANTY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

ESTIMATE DELIVERY

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 30 Days 

after receipt

N/A

YOUR REF. NO. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

QUOTATION

N/A N/A 10/21/2014 9/26/14-10/31/14 N/A 60 Days 

after receipt

N/A

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB WB SB SB SB SB SB

MEN'S BASKETBALL: WOMEN'S BASKETBALL: SOFTBALL: BASEBALL:

CAPITAL TRAILWAYS: LINE ITEMS 1, 3, 4 & 10. CAPITAL TRAILWAYS: LINE ITEM 2. CAPITAL TRAILWAYS: CAPITAL TRAILWAYS:

SPIRIT COACH:  LINE ITEMS 6, 7 & 9. SPIRIT COACH: LINE ITEMS 1, 4, 5 & 6. LINE ITEMS 1, 3, 4, 5, 6 & 8. LINE ITEMS: 4, 5, 7, 8, 9 &10.

CAMELOT BUS CHARTER: LINE ITEM 5. CAMELOT BUS CHARTER: LINE ITEM 3. SPIRIT COACH: LINE ITEM 7. SPIRIT COACH: LINE ITEM 6.

ADVENTURE BUS CHARTER: LINE ITEM 8. GRAYLINE OF TN: LINE ITEM 2. CAMELOT BUS CHARTER: 

LINE ITEMS: 1, 2, 3 & 11.

This Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low to the Lowest Responsible Bidders who met the Bid Specifications.

EMP: 10/7/2014


