
CHARTER BUSES FOR ATHLETICS FALL 2013 -2014 (B002228)

ADVENTURE 

BUS SPIRIT COACH
ANCHOR

GRAYLINE OF  

TN CLINE TOURS

Line Items 2 & 4 have been cancelled

CROSS COUNTRY

1.  9/20/13 - 9/21/13 2,150.00$     2,640.00$    3,188.00$       2,595.00$   No Bid

2.  10/4/13 - 10/5/13 1,650.00$     1,540.00$    1,853.00$       1,885.00$   No Bid

3. 10/11/13 - 10/12/13 2,300.00$     2,640.00$    3,127.00$       2,595.00$   4,135.00$                 

4.  10/25/13 - 10/26/13 1,650.00$     1,540.00$    1,853.00$       1,885.00$   No Bid

5. 11/7/13 - 11/9/13 4,300.00$     4,420.00$    5,618.00$       5,895.00$   6,470.00$                 

SUB TOTAL 12,050.00$   12,780.00$  15,639.00$     14,855.00$ 10,605.00$              

Line Items 3 & 4 have been cancelled

MEN'S SOCCER

1.     9/20/13 - 9/22/13 2,800.00$     3,060.00$    2,813.00$       3,195.00$   3,950.00$                 

2.     9/26/13 - 9/29/13 3,150.00$     2,860.00$    3,705.00$       3,495.00$   3,380.00$                 

3.  10/9/13 1,050.00$     885.00$       1,283.00$       1,575.00$   1,700.00$                 

4.   10/25/13 1,050.00$     885.00$       1,168.00$       1,575.00$   1,685.00$                 

5.   11/1/13 1,150.00$     1,030.00$    1,569.00$       1,615.00$   2,205.00$                 

SUB TOTAL 9,200.00$     8,720.00$    10,538.00$     11,455.00$ 12,920.00$              

VOLLEYBALL

1.   9/5/13 - 9/7/13 2,850.00$     3,025.00$    3,255.00$       3,495.00$   4,125.00$                 

2.   9/19/13 - 9/21/13 2,850.00$     2,740.00$    3,315.00$       3,565.00$   4,345.00$                 

3. 11/8/13 - 11/9/13 2,100.00$     3,060.00$    2,813.00$       2,795.00$   3,950.00$                 

SUB TOTAL 7,800.00$     8,825.00$    9,383.00$       9,855.00$   12,420.00$              

Line Items 1, 4, 6 and 7  have been cancelled.

Line  Item 8 has been changed to 11/6/13 - 11/10/13

WOMEN'S SOCCER

1.     8/18/13 1,000.00$     1,030.00$    1,692.00$       1,835.00$   2,335.00$                 

2.    9/5/13 - 9/6/13 1,900.00$     1,640.00$    2,031.00$       2,425.00$   2,375.00$                 

3.    9/13/13 - 9/15/13 2,850.00$     2,740.00$    3,315.00$       3,295.00$   3,666.00$                 

4.    9/25/13 850.00$        885.00$       1,168.00$       1,595.00$   1,484.00$                 

5. 10/1/13 950.00$        1,340.00$    1,987.00$       2,025.00$   2,374.00$                 

6. 10/4/13 1,200.00$     1,340.00$    1,830.00$       1,875.00$   2,525.00$                 

7. 11/2/13 1,150.00$     1,030.00$    1,569.00$       1,835.00$   2,250.00$                 

8.  10/6/13 - 10/10/13 INCORRECT DATES

CORRECT DATE IS:

 11/6/13 - 11/10/13 NO BID 3,480.00$    4,631.00$       4,590.00$   4,660.00$                 

SUB TOTAL 9,900.00$     13,485.00$  18,223.00$     19,475.00$ 21,669.00$              



GRAND TOTAL 38,950.00$   43,810.00$  53,783.00$     55,640.00$ 57,614.00$              

UAHUNTSVILLE N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

TERMS N/A NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30

WARRANTY NONE N/A N/A N/A N/A

ESTIMATED DELIVERY N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

YOUR REFERENCE NO. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

QUOTATION EFFECTIVE UNTIL N/A 8/24/2013 7/30/2013 9/13/2013 N/A

BUSINESS CLASSIFICATION SB SB SB SB SB

This Bid has been Awarded by Line Item Low as per the Bid Specifications:

Cross Country: Line Items 1, 3, 5 to Adventure Bus Charter - 

Men's Soccer: Line Item 1 to Adventure Bus Charter - Line Items 2 & 5 to Spirit Coach

Volleyball: Line Items 1 & 3 to Adventure Bus Charter - Line Item 2 to Spirit Coach

Women's Soccer: Line Items 2, 3 & 8 to Spirit Coach -  Line Item 5 to Adventure Bus Charter - 

8/7/2013
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