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Item Qty Description Price Price Price
1 ANIMAL STUDIES:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 No bid

Part number # UHAS1LC # LC00796
16 Dwarf African Frogs $86.50 $84.00

*Xenopus
32 Elodea Sprigs or substitute

1 Food, Brine Shrimp, Flake, 1.09 – oz

1 Food, Fish

1 Instant Ocean, Pkg
1 Soil, Woodland Terrarium
1 Pacific Plankton, 2-oz bottle

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 
Part number # 972400BLC # LC00797

16 Fiddler Crabs, (8 male, 8 female) $69.95 $65.55

Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3
Part number # 972400CLC # LC01005

16 Millipedes 39..95 $71.90
3 Moss Mats

TOTAL: $196.40 $221.45

2 ECOSYSTEMS:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1

Part number # 972800ALC # LC00799(A)

44 Elodea Sprigs or substitute $74.50 $84.85

1 Pack of 330 Duckweed Plants

4 Algae Mix, Jar

30 Pond Snails

30 Gambusia/Mosquito Fish *Guppies

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 

Part number # 972800BLC # LC00800

30 Crickets $49.95 $27.50

30 Isopods/Pill Bugs

TOTAL: $124.45 $112.35

3 INVESTIGATING BIODIVERSITY AND INTERDEPENDENCE:
Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 

Part number # STL2141000LC no bid

2 WOWBugs (Melittobia digitata), $54.95 $54.95 wash

1 Blackworms (Lumbriculus variegatus), 
1 Pack of 225 Duckweed (Lemna minor)

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2

Part number # STL5143000LC no bid
12 Elodea Sprigs or substitute $27.95 $27.95 wash

1 Algae, Collected Spirogyra

Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3 
Part number # STL9144000LC no bid

1 Protozoa, Amoeba Proteus Culture $36.95 $36.95 wash

1 Protozoa, Euglena Jar Culture
1 Protozoa, Paramecium Multi Culture
1 Algae, Volvox Globator, Jar

Card #4 Unit Cost per Card #4 Unit Cost per Card #4 
Part number # UHB04LC no bid

1 Blackworms (Lumbriculus variegatus), $29.95 $29.95 wash

1 L565-Daphnia
1 L55-Hydra
1 L51C-Daphnia Food, 4-oz

TOTAL: $149.80 $149.80 wash

Not included w/card but 

included w/kit



4 STUDYING THE DEVELOPMENT AND REPRODUCTION OF ORGANISMS:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 
Part number # STL5143000LC # LC01007

1 Algae, Collected, Spirogyra culture $27.95 $39.60

12 Elodea Sprigs or substitute
1 Pack of 225 Duckweed (Lemna minor)

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2

Part number # STL6142000LC no bid

8 Brassica Butterfly Eggs $27.95 $27.95 wash

TOTAL: $59.95 $67.55 wash

5 ORGANISMS:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 

Part number # 971100C # LC00795

16 Pill Bugs $59.95 $57.25

8 Millipedes or Bess Beetles

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2

Part number # 971100B # LC00794

18 Guppies (9 male, 9 female) $49.95 $39.50

Aquatic Snails

Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3 Unit Cost per Card #3 

Part number # 971100A # LC00793

9 Elodea Sprigs or substitute $49.95 $93.25

7 Gymnosperm-Tree Seedlings

7 Cabomba

4 Moss Mats

TOTAL: $159.85 $190.00

6 MICROWORLDS:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1

Part number # 972700 no bid

1 Blepharisma Jar Culture 19.95 $19.95 wash

1 Volvox Jar Culture

1 Vinegar Eel Culture 

TOTAL: 19.95 $19.95 wash

7 ANIMALS TWO BY TWO:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 

Part number # UH2X21LC # LC01006

6 Elodea Sprigs or substitute $67.95 $71.90

12 Ramborn Snails

4 Goldfish

8 Guppies

12 Aquatic Snails

Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2 Unit Cost per Card #2

Part number # UH2X22LC # LC00831(A)

30 Redworms 49.95 67.55

12 Earthworms-medium

25 Pill Bugs

25 Sowbugs

TOTAL: 117.90 $139.45

8 SOILS:

Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1 Unit Cost per Card #1

Part number # 141650LC # LC00204

100 75-100 ea- Red Worms $16.50 $24.25

TOTAL: $16.50 $24.95

Grand Total $784.85 $925.50



Business classification LB Corportation

FOB UAHuntsville UAHuntsville 

Terms Net 30 Net 30 days

Estimated delivery
14-28 days 

coupon Immediately                  

3-4 week redemption

Reference number 240200 SQ 84510

Warranty

Quotation effective until 30-Sep-14 30-Sep-14

7/9/2013 PKH

The bid is awarded by total low to Carolina Biological Supply Company as the 

apparent lowest responsible bidder, meeting specifications. 



From the Uline catalog online
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