Item Product Number Product Description Mfr Qty size Affordable Janitorial Supplies
Unit Price Ext Price
Clear plastic salad container
1 CD48DE o 7 3/8/x2-3/8 DART | 10CS $ 82.00 $ 820.00
2 PS95B Blue Plastic Plates, 9" SOLO 2CS S 160.00 S 320.00
3 #PS95R - Red Plastic Plates, 9" SOLO 2CS 250/cs S 160.00 S 320.00
4 #PS95W - White Plastic Plates, 9" SOLO 5CS 500/cs S 160.00 S 800.00
5 #PS95Y - Yellow Plastic Plates, 9" SOLO 2CS 500/cs S 160.00 S 320.00
6 #PS15W - White Plastic Plates, 10" SOLO 5CS 500/cs S 220.00 $ 1,100.00
7 4DMS 8-0z Clear Plastic Deli/Gourmet 500/
- Container SOLO  10CS CS $ 87.50 $ 875.00
#DM16 - 16-0z Clear Plastic
8 DM16 Deli/Gourmet Container SOLO 10 CS 500/cs S 110.00 | S 1,100.00
9 #LGS8 - Clear Plastic Lid for 8-0z and 16- 10/cs
oz Deli/Gourmet Containers SOLO S 60.00 S 600.00
10 #TK35 - 3.5-0z Clear Plastic Cup SOLO 3CS 3/cs S 165.00 S 495.00
5 No-Slot Plastic Lid for 3.5-0z 3/
11 #PL2 - Cup SOLO | 3CS cs $ 52.00 $ 156.00
12 #TP7 - 7-o0z Clear Plastic Cup SOLO 15CS 15/cs S 95.00 $ 1,425.00
13 #TPOC - 9-0z Clear Plastic Tall Cup SOLO 10 CS 10/cs S 101.00 S 1,010.00
14 4pLa No-Slot Plastic Lid for 7-0z and /
- 9-0z Tall Cup SOLO  8cs 8lcs $ 70.00 $ 560.00
9 9-0z Clear Plastic Souffle /
15 #TP9 - Coctail Cup SOLO | 15CS 15/cs $ 95.00 $ 1,425.00
No-Slot Plastic Lid for 9-0z
16 #662TP - gsouffle Cup or 20-0z Cup SOLO  10CS 10/cs $ 67.00 $ 670.00
17 #TP10 10-0z Clear Plastic Highball Cup  SOLO  15¢cs ~ 1000/Cs ¢ 95.00 $ 1,425.00
18 #600TS - Straw Slot Lid for 10-0z Cup soLo | 10cs ~ 29°00/cs ¢ 95.00 $ 950.00
19 #TP16 - 16-0z Clear Plastic Cup SOLO 8 CS 1000/cs S 110.00 S 880.00
20 4626TS Straw Slot Plastic Lid for 160z 1000/
- cup SOLO 3CS S g 50.25 S 150.75
5 0 1-0z Graduated Clear Plastic 000/
1 #P10IM - Medicine Cup SOLO | 5cCS S000/cs ¢ 152.00 $ 760.00




Item Product Number Product Description Mfr Qty size Affordable Janitorial Supplies
Unit Price ‘Ext Price
1-oz Translucent Plastic Souffle /
22 #P100 - Cup soLo  ecs  2000fcs 4 7500 $ 450.00
1.25-0z Clear Plastic Souffle
23 H#T125 - Cup soLo  scs  0000/cs g 170.00 $ 850.00
Clear Plastic Lid, no slot, for 1-
24 #PL-1 oz and 1.25-0z Souffle Cup SOLO 6 CS 5000/cs $ 70.00 S 420.00
2-0z Translucent Plastic Souffle
25 #T200 - Cup soLo | 3cs ~ °000fcs o 5200 $ 156.00
26 #TH200 - 2-0z Clear Plastic Souffle Cup SOLO 3CS 2500/cs S 79.00 S 237.00
27 #T250 - 2.5-0z Clear Plastic Souffle Cup|  SOLO 3CS 5000/cs S 238.40 S 715.20
No-Slot Plastic Lid for 2-0z and
28 #PL2 - 2.5-0z Souffle Cups SOLO 2CS 2500/cs S 60.00 S 120.00
2-piece Treated 3-0z White
29 #44 Paper Cup SOLO 2CS 5000/cs S 175.00 S 350.00
8-0z Clear Plastic Desert
30 #SDS8 - Container SOLO 2CS 1000/cs S 120.00 $ 240.00
31 #TN20 - Clear Plastic 20-0z Cup SOLO 2CS 1000/cs S 170.00 | $ 510.00
32 #TD24 - Clear Plastic 24-0z Cup SOLO 3CS 600/cs S 105.00 S 315.00
33 #DL626 - Clear Plastic Lid for 24-0z Cup SOLO 3CS S 120.00 $ 360.00
32-0z Clear Plastic Deli
34 #DM32 - Container SOLO 3CS 500/cs S 135.00 S 405.00
35 #T400 - 4-0z Clear Plastic Souffle Cup SOLO 3CS 2500/cs S 14560 $ 145.60
36 #58MD - 5-0z Waxed Paper Cups SOLO 2CS 2500/cs S 110.75 S 221.50
37 #67MD - 6-0z Waxed Paper Cups SOLO 2CS 2500/cs S 110.75 $ 221.50
38 #87MD - 8-0z Waxed Paper Cups SOLO 2CS 2500/cs S 100.00 S 200.00
Paper Hot Drink Cup - 6-0z,
39 #376MD - Meridian SOLO 2CS 1000/cs S 67.50 S 135.00
Paper Hot Drink Cup - 8-0z,
40 #378MD - Meridian Poly Lined SOLO 2CS 1000/cs S 80.00 S 160.00
41 #200-2050 - 2-0z White Paper Souffle Cups SOLO 2CS 5000/cs S 80.00 $ 160.00




Item Product Number Product Description Mfr Qty size Affordable Janitorial Supplies
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Classic 7" Full-Size Polystyrene

42 #10018 - tspn, Heavy Weight, Alimond SOLO 5CS 1000/cs S 55.00 $ 275.00
Classic Oriented Bulk, Heavy

43 #10021-  Weight, White Knife soLo  2cs  1000fcs g 55.00 $ 110.00
Classic Oriented Bulk, Heavy

44 #10020 - Weight, White Fork SOLO | 3Cs 1000/cs B8 55.00 $ 165.00
Taster Spoons, 3", White Light

45 #70037 - Weight Plastic 6cs  3000/cs o 40.00 $ 240.00
7"x4"x2" Corrugated Mailer Box,

46 #M456 - White, 1-Piece Folder sopun  20/Bundle ¢ 92.50 $ 4,625.00
White Paper Plates, 9", light

47 weight 4CS 1200/cs S 84.00 S 84.00
Clear Plastic Container,

48 #IVEX-4196 -  3.5"x3.5" 2CS No Bid No Bid
Brown Lunch Bags, 5-1/8"x3-

49 #SNG 5% - 1/8"x10-3/4" 5 PKG |500/pkg S 72.00 $ 360.00
3"x5" Jewelry-Size Clear Plastic

50 #ELK-F40305 - |Resealable Bag, 4-mil 20 CS |1000/cs S 250.00 | $ 1,250.00
6"x9" Quart-Size Clear Plastic

51  #ELK-F20609 - Resealable Bag, 2-mil 20CS $ 25.00 $ 500.00
6.5"x6" Sandwich Resealable

52 #DRA-94600 - |Bag 15 CS 500/cs S 20.00 S 300.00
4x4 pint-size clear plastic

53 ELK-F20406 resealable bag, 2-mil 10 CS 1000/cs S 1250 S 125.00
10"x13" Clear Plastic

54  #ELK-F21013 - Resealable Bag, 2-mil 10 CS 1000/cs S 60.00 | S 600.00
Clear Plastic Resealable Bag, 4

55 #ELK-F41318  mil 5CS 500/cs S 88.00 S 440.00
Jumbo Wrapped Translucent

56 #285IT-12 - Straw, 7.75" 2 CS |500/bx, 12 bx/cs S 55.90 S 111.80
Jumbo Unwrapped White/Red

57 #2851S - Stripe Straw, 7.75" 2 CS |500/bx, 24 bx/cs S 55.90 $ 110.80
Wrapped White Straw, 7.75",

58 #F381 - Flexible 2 CS |400/bx, 25 bx/cs S 65.00 S 144.50
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Super Jumbo 7.75" Clear,

59 #3851T - Wrapped Straw 2 CS |400/bx, 24 bx/cs S 75.00 $ 195.70
Giant 7.75" Striped, Wrapped

60 #4851S - Straw 3 CS 300/bx, 24 bxics S 82.00 S 246.00

61 10" Wooden Skewers 5CS S 75.00 S 375.00

62 Toothpicks, Flat 2CS S 30.00 $ 60.00

63 Toothpicks, Round 2CS S 45.00 S 90.00
24" 50-Ib Brown Kraft Paper,

64 #SWP - 8.5" Dia, Recycled 3RLS 1roll S 21.50 $ 64.50
Paper, Butcher, White, 1000 ft.

65 long, 24" wide 3RLS 1roll S 30.00 S 90.00
Paper, Butcher, White, 1000 ft.

66 long, 18" wide 3RLS 1 roll S 23.50 $ 69.00
Paper, Butcher, White, 1000 ft

67 long, 36" wide 3RLS 1roll S 45.00 S 135.00
Blue Nitrile Glove, Medium, Non- 100/bx,

68 |#TRX-NMD5201 - Medical, Powder-Free, 5-mil 3CS |10/bc/cs S 75.00 S 225.00
Latex Glove, Medium, Power 100/bx,

69 #TRX-LMD5201 - |Free, Non-Sterile 3CsS |10/bc/cs S 4750 S 142.50

70 HFA-30430 - 9" Aluminum Pie Tins 3CS S 75.50 $ 226.50
CP66 - 1/2" Natural Masking

71 #SHU-104045- Tape, Industrial Crepe 5CS 72/cs S 56.50 S 282.50
3/4" Natural Masking Tape,

72 #ITP-70830-515 - Utility Grade 5CS 48/cs S 42,95 S 260.00

73 1" Natural Masking Tape 5CS S 4295 S 260.00
AC30 - 2" Silver Duct Tape,

74 #ITP-72878- General Purpose 6 CS 24/cs S 175.00 $ 1,050.00
Bounty Paper Towels, 2-ply, 60

75 #PNG-40725 - sheets/roll 15CS 30/cs S 56.00 $ 840.00
Carry Out Tray, beige, 7"x9",

76 #CHI-20918 - Factor 5CS 500/cs S 85.00 S 425.00
2" Clear Polypropylene Carton
Sealing Tape, Standard Duty, 2-

77 #TAI-1182 - mil 8CS 36/cs S 50.00 $ 400.00




Affordable Janitorial Supplies

Bid Bond Y/N No No

FOB Point UAH Destination = UAH Destination
Terms N30

Warranty Factory

Delivery Sept 30 2010

Your Reference No. AF0207

Quotation Effective

1day instock/7days

nonstock
Percentage off items not specifically listed 15%
Surcharge for 24 hr delivery 0
Normal delivery for in-stock item 12hrs
Produce accurate and up-to-date report Yes

Affordable Janitorial: 1-6, 10-16, 21-30, 34-47, 56-75, 77

Nature Friendly Products: 7-8, 9, 17-20, 31-33, 48, 76

Boritex: 50-54

Bid awarded by line item low meeting specs.




Nature Friendly Product Boritex Nutec Notes
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price
S 59.20 S 947.20 No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 70.64 S 70.64 | No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 70.64 S 70.64  No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 70.64 S 70.64 | No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 70.64 S 70.64  No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 5183 S 51.83 | No Bid No Bid NFP did not meet color specs.
S 118.61 | S 355.84 No Bid No Bid
S 116.06 S 580.32 No Bid No Bid
66.02/80z /$51.22/160z S 454.13 No Bid No Bid
S 101.38 S 304.15 No Bid No Bid NFP lids and cup do not meet specs
S 66.14 S 198.41 No Bid No Bid NFP lids and cup do not meet specs
S 93.54 | S 748.36 | No Bid No Bid NFP lids and cup do not meet specs
S 82.05 | S 820.45 | No Bid No Bid NFP lids and cup do not meet specs
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S 82.05 | § 1,230.68  No Bid No Bid NFP did not have lids
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S 82.05 S 1,230.68 No Bid No Bid
S 4037 S 1,009.30 No Bid No Bid
S 106.44 S 851.49 No Bid No Bid
S 4037 S 121.12 No Bid No Bid
S 69.12 S 622.10 No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups




Nature Friendly Product Boritex Nutec Notes
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price
S 69.12 S 691.22 No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
69..12 S 622.10 | No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
S 66.18 S 198.55 No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
S 66.18 S 397.09 No Bid No Bid NFPcups do not meet specs
S 44.46 | S 88.92 ' No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
S 57.06 $ 570.58 No Bid No Bid NFP lids does not fit cups
S 118.61 S 118.61 No Bid No Bid NFP Icups do not meet specs
S 123.86 S 371.58 No Bid No Bid
S 131.05 S 262.09 No Bid No Bid
S 40.37 No Bid No Bid
S 130.90 | S 392.69 | No Bid No Bid NFP-container do not meet specs
S 51.98 $ 259.91  No Bid No Bid NFP lids incorrect fit
S 57.06 | S 285.29 | No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
S 81.50 | S 407.50 No Bid No Bid NFP lids incorrect fit
S 81.50 S 407.50 No Bid No Bid NFP lids incorrect fit
S 81.50 | § 81.50 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
S 49.62 | S 99.23 | No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
S 55.94 §$ 279.70  No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs




Nature Friendly Product Boritex Nutec Notes
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price
S 62.39 S 311.97 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
S 61.68 S 123.36 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
S 63.60 S 123.36 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet specs
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S 70.64 | S 353.20 No Bid No Bid

NFPAlternate: #DM8-80z clear plastiv Deli/Gourmet

S 48.00 S 960.00 No Bid No Bid container. Submitted as item #7 alternate
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 11.70 No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 17.10 No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 13.50 No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 8.75 No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 40.15 No Bid
No Bid No Bid S 126.40 No Bid
S 41.16 S 246.96 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet color specs
S 41.16 S 493.92 | No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet color specs
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Nature Friendly Product Notes
Boritex Nutec
Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price
S 41.16 S 411.60 | No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet color specs
S 41.16 S 452.76 No Bid No Bid NFP does not meet color specs
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S 60.19 S 300.95 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Nature Friendly Product Boritex Nutec Notes
No No No
UAH Destination UAH Destination UAH Destination
N30 N30
0
30-Sep-10 Sept 30 2010
B001902
5-7 days 5-10 days
N/A 15%
TBD Freight
5-7 days 2-7days
Yes Yes
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