Bid B0O01903

Carolina Biological
Supplies

ANIMAL STUDIES

Card #1 ‘

$78.95

16 Dwarf African Frogs

32 Elodea Sprigs

Card #2 ‘

$42.50

16 Fiddler Crabs, (8 male, 8 female)

Card #3 ‘

$78.95

16 Millipedes

3 Moss Mats

TOTAL

$200.40

ECOSYSTEMS

Card #1

$74.50

44 Elodea Sprigs

1 Pack of 330 Duckweed Plants

30 Algae Mix, Jar

30 Pond Snails

30 Gambusia/Mosquito Fish

Card #2

$59.50

30 Crickets

30 Isopods

TOTAL

$134.00

ORGANISMS

Card #1 ‘

$56.95

16 Pill Bugs

8 Millipedes or Bess Beetles

Card #2 ‘

$59.00

18 Guppies (9 male, 9 female)

18 Aquatic Snails

Card #3 ‘

$67.25

9 Elodea Sprigs

7 Gymnosperm-Tree Seedlings

7 Cabomba

4 Moss Mats

TOTAL

$183.20

MICROWORLDS

Card #1

$22.50

1 Blepharisma Jar Cu

lture

1 Volvox Jar Culture

1 Vinegar Eel Culture

TOTAL

$22.50

Sempco, Inc

included

included

included

$135.58

included

included

$99.25

included

incuded

included

$110.25

included

$19.86

Science Lab.Com

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$14.25

$14.25

no bid

$34.99

no bid

$34.99

$12.19

$12.19




Carolina Biological
Supplies

ANIMALS TWO BY TWO

Card #1

$42.75

6 Elodea

4 Goldfish

8 Guppies

Card #2 ‘

$24.25

12 Aquatic Snails

12 Ramhorn Snails

Card #3 ‘

$22.50

30 Redworms

12 Earthworms-medium

Card#4 ‘

$26.75

25 Pill Bugs

25 Sowbugs

TOTAL

$116.25

ORGANISMS - FROM MACRO TO MICRO

Card #1

$60.00

2 Melittobia Live Culture

1 Lumbriculus Variegatus

1 Pack of 225 Duckweed

Card #2 ‘ ‘

$30.00

8 Brassica Butterfly Eggs

Card #3 ‘ ‘

$30.00

1 Algae, Collected, Spirogyra

12 Elodea Sprigs ‘

1 Pack of 225 Duckweed

Card #4 ‘

$42.00

1 Protozoa, Amoeba Proteus Culture

1 Protozoa, Paramecium Multi Culture

1 Protozoa, Euglena Jar Culture

1 Algae, Volvox Globator, Jar

Card #5

$50.00

2 L55-Hydra

3 L565-Daphnia

1 L51C-Daphnia Food, 4 oz

1 Lumbriculus Variegatus

TOTAL

$212.00

SOILS

Card #1

$17.95

75-100 Red Worms

TOTAL

$17.95

GRAND TOTAL

$1,772.40

Sempco, Inc

included

included

included

included

$82.50

$21.50

$8.98

$15.85

$17.95

$21.45

$85.73

$12.94

$12.94
$546.11

Science Lab.Com

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$16.25

no bid

$16.25

no bid

no bid

$77.68




Carolina Biological
Supplies

Sempco, Inc  Science Lab.Com

Business classification

FOB UAH UAH UAH
Terms N30 N30
Warranty

Estimated delivery 14-25 days 5-10 days 60 days
Reference number 94998 SQ

Quotation effective until 9/30/2010 9/30/2010 Sep-10
Free Shipping/included in pricing Yes Included Bill Separately

Bid awarded total low to Sempco, Inc as lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications
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